
COUNTY OF ERIE 
MARK C. POLONCARZ 
COUNTY EXECUTIVE 

DIVISION OF PURCHASE 

TO: ALL USING DEPARTMENTS 

FROM: Tricia Pierce, Buyer 

DATE: April 20, 2020 

SUBJECT: CONTRACT FOR TOWING SERVICES 
BID NO.: 221052-004 
TERM: FEBRUARY 1, 2021 -JANUARY 31, 2022 

++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++ 
This is to advise you that there is a new contract for "TOWING SERVICES 
There are now eight vendors on this contract. 

The services provided in this contract include Towing (to one of the five county highway garages), Battery 
Service either jump start or replacement, Tire Changing, Lock Out Service and Fuel Delivery. These services 
will be available on a 24/7/365 basis. Please use the vendor that services your location with the lowest price for 
the service you need. 

For your convenience I have listed the vendor information on the attached sheets. 
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BID NO.: 221052-004 
TOWING SERVICES 

VENDOR: DADSWELL SERVICE, INC. - Vendor #110575 
8490 Main Street 
Williamsville, NY 14221 
Telephone #633- 7276 

VENDOR: Bach's Service & Towing- Vendor #111089 
930 Maple Road 
Elma NY 14052 
Telephone #652-8800 

VENDOR: RUSINIAK'S SERVICE, INC. - Vendor #101012 
2210 Old Union Road 
Cheektowaga, NY 14227 
Telephone #656-8479 

VENDOR: SMOKEY'S TOWING - Vendor #145253 
1760 West Ave. 
Marilla, NY 14102 
Telephone #359-2457 

VENDOR: Marty's Towing- Vendor #110947 
17 41 Baseline Rd. 
Grand Island, NY 14072 
Telephone #773-3515 

VENDOR: Evans Mechanicai- Vendor #i6û30û 
8596 Erie. Rd. 
Angola, NY 14006 
Telephone #549-2121 

VENDOR: Triple T Towing - Vendor #117007 
971 Ransom Rd. 
Lancaster, NY 14086 
Telephone #685-3193 

VENDOR: Wally's Towing - Vendor #170302 
5346 Broadway 
Lancaster, NY 14086 
Telephone #683-9688 

District #1 Northwest includes Grand Island, Kenmore, Tonawanda, Amherst, Williamsville, City of Buffalo, 
Cheektowaga, Lackawanna and West Seneca 

District #2 -Northeast includes Clarence, Newstead, Alden, Lancaster, Depew, Elma, Marilla 

District #3 - Southwest includes Blasdell, Hamburg, Orchard Park, Boston, Eden, Evans, Brant and Collins 

District #4 - Southeast includes Aurora, East Aurora, Holland, Wales, West Falls, Sardinia and Concord 



Bl~ N9__:__2~_'!_Q.?~..:--º_04 _!Q!!IN~~ERVIC~§._ __ Dadswel_l_ .~arty's .. _ ~~ch's 3~s."-_ia~~- __ ~mokey•~ _ _!:vans Tr:ï_ple_!_ Wally __ . 
,_I: !"i_Q_9~_UP C~~RGE~ _ _ ~igh!_ _!85.QO~ea ,$_~:º~e~_ ,!75.00/e~_ $85.00/ea .. . ~~:OOLea _§7~.0ºl~a 1~.J25:QO!e~ _ _!1~1-ºJ!!_ea __ 

___ Medium'$175.00/hr_ .$125.00 __ ,$140.00/ea :$175.00/hr ------~35.00/ea _$175.00/hr _;$150.00/hr $150.00/hr 
Heavy $225.00/hr N/A ,$195.00/hr $235.00/hr No Bid $195.00/hr '$250.00/hr $250.00/hr 

·- ~iht-=-$~(Q.O/ea .$j5.00 ... - ;$75.ÔÓ/;a -· . J~!OQ!e~ }~?_4.00/ea __ ]ss.öo,ja -11.f5jo]!ª - Jf2-5.ö"~Tea 
Medium $150.00/hr N/A $140.00/ea $175.00/hr $135.00/ea $175.00/hr $150.00/hr $150.00/hr -- - --- -· ~ - ---- - -- ·--· ·--- ·- ---·- -~-- - - ---- - -- - - ·•· ----- 

Heavy $195.00/hr N/A , $195.00/hr $235.00/hr No Bid $195.00/hr $250.00/hr $250.00/hr 
-Lig.ht -- .$5:ooJia-- . f4.00/ea : $-2.00/ea .. $4~50/ea ---$2.00/ea - . $3:50/~~ . $4~00 $4:00- . 

.. -- ~ _fv,e~~~- :Port t~ P~~ $5.oo ~ $_f~~~ = =}§!_A -- - }}óru8a _ ~ NIA -- . j4.Q_º_ $4~o0 - . 
Heavy Port to Port N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A $5.00 $5.00 

Part II. Battery Service: jump start -Light - - ¡ $95.()0/ea . -~5.00 I $75.00/ea $à5~0/ea . $74.00/ea ... ~$-7'5.00/hr .. $85.00/ea $85.00/ea 
- - ··-- ¡_ -- - - -- --· -- -- - - -- --- -- - - -·- - --- -- ·- 

Medium $125.00 N/A · $95.00/ea $85.00+105p/hr $90.00/ea $95.00/hr $85.00/ea $85.00/ea 
- ---~8~i_~$}~óo NIA J~45.00/;~ ·· -~$~~o_o+-Î~5p/~r-J!40~00/ea ·Î125.ooihr 1_1_~.oo ·- )~~J·ºº __ ' 

Light __ N!~- N/A $I_5:~0/ea _ ~o _!!_id ~o-~i~ _$7~_0/hr ,!_9~.00/h_i:_ $95.<!_0/h~ 
Medium N/A N/A $95.00/ea No Bid · No Bid $95.00/hr $95.00/hr $95.00/hr 

-------·------ . - ------- ------ -- -- ~- ·•- -- --··--· - -- -· .. J........:......------ 

Heavy N/A N/A $145.00/ea No Bid No Bid $125.00/hr $95.00/hr $95.00/hr 
- __ L~9ht~J95Jiº'~ª - - $9_5.00 jf~óoï~a - ~j!5.00/ea -,$?{QO/e_a $75.00~-;:- - :j~5:Q~~~ _!_1~5:00/~a - . 

Medium N/A N/A N/A $85.00+105p/hr No Bid $95.00/hr N/A N/A 
Heavy N/A- ·· Ñ/A . N/A - ·· $85.00+-105p/h-¡:- · NÓ Bid -· $125.0Ö/hr N/A NIA ·· - - 

-~- Ugh_! ~ J~~.ooi~~ $~5 .. Öo ; $7§)0/~a . $~.OÓJei==~ -=-~~f"ooJea _ _£s.o_ó1h_! . . $125.0-0/ea :$125.-º.Q/e~ -· 
Medium $95.00/ea N/A -- $75.00/ea $85.00+105p/hr $74.00/ea $75.00/hr $125.00/ea $125.00/ea 

·Hea~--!$125.00/ea .. . N/A ··- $75.00Ïea - $85.00+105p/h-;.-$74.00ka ;$75.00/h;- -$12-5.00/ea $125~00/ea 
Light 1$125.00/hr 1125.00 $95.00Ïea· .$1-25:ÔO -- $90.00 -;$95.00/hr. ···s12s~o,iïr --$125:c,othr 

----- ----l-- ·-· ·- -·-- -- ----- - --- - r- -- . ------ -- ---· - _ __¡. __ - - --•-------- 

Medium $175.00/hr N/A $115.00/ea $175.00/hr $100.00 $175.00/hr $150.00/hr $150.00/hr 
He~v_y - ~ ;l225ß~hr- -- :Ni~- - . - J31s.'..001~r J$~~5~oofü_r-_ -~ ~NO ~ra ~ $195:_º0/h~_J$25Ò~cfö/tïr- ·s2~º-:~~}.ffr _ 

$125.00+fuel $65.00+fuel $75.00/+fuel $85.00+fuel $74.00+fuel $75.00+fuel $85.00+fuel $85.00+fuel 
--·--- -· ·- - -- - · '· ! ... -· I --- - - l- ---- - --- 

Flat Bed: 

Price p~_r -~i~~: 

- - ---·· - 
Battery Replacement:_ 

- - . 
Part Ill: Tire C_llanginj[_ 

Part IV. Lock Out Service 

Part V. Winching Service_ 

Fuel Delivery _ 

District 
---- --- --· - ----- 

· District #1 District #1 District #3 District #1 
... --- . . - -- -- - ··-------- - 

District #2 District #4 District #2 District #3 --------- - - - . - ·•- --- -- 
District #3 

··- - -- - -- --- -- - - -- 
District #3 District #2 District #2 


