

AUTO AND TRUCK LUBRICANTS
Bid #222026-004

MATERIAL GROUP: 060, PURCHASING GROUP #004

VENDOR INFORMATION:

BWE/ NOCO ENERGY – Vendor #159314

100 James Ave.
Tonawanda, NY 14150
Telephone #716-954-4430

SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS – Vendor #108483

32 Ward Road
North Tonawanda, NY 14120
Telephone #693-8412
Fax #716-695-9087

HEAVY DUTY DIESEL ENGINE OILS

	<u>TRADE NAME</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>
1. SAE 15W – 40 API SN/CJ4, MIL-L 2104 D	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case-12 Quarts (65619)	\$555.10/dr \$37.15/cs	BWE BWE
2. SAE 30W – API SJ/CD	Naviguard/Peak Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case – 6 Quarts (P3M0076)	\$575.75/dr \$19.58/cs	BWE BWE
3. SAE 40W API SJ/CD	<u>Maxx Perf HD 40w</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$625.00/dr	Superior
4. SAE 15W 40 Chevron Delo 400 Multigrade	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$555.10/dr	BWE

GASOLINE ENGINES, LIGHT DUTY DIESEL ENGINES

1. SAE 5W-30 API SN/CC	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum) Price/5 Gallon Pails	\$470.25/dr \$47.00/ea	BWE BWE
2. SAE 10W-30 API SN/CC MIL-L46152B	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$470.25/dr	BWE
3. SAE 10W-30 CJ4 Semi Synthetic	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$562.10/dr	BWE
4. SAE 10W-40 API SN/CC, MIL-L46152B	<u>Maxx Perf 10w40</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pails	\$500.00/dr \$52.00/ea	Superior Superior
5. SAE 30W API SJ/CD 55 Gallon	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$592.25/dr	BWE
6. SAE 5W-40 Synthetic CJ4	Naviguard Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pail	\$968.90dr \$94.08	BWE BWE
7. SAE 5W-20 API SN/CE	<u>Naviguard/Maxx Perf SB 5w20</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case-6 Qt (65603)	\$470.25/dr \$18.00	BWE Superior
8. SAE 0W-20 Full SYN DEXSO1	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/12Qts (65611)	\$633.75/dr \$42.34	BWE BWE
9. SAE 5W-30 Full SYN DEXSO1 Gen2	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$633.75/dr	BWE

NON-DETERGENT PRODUCTS

	<u>TRADE NAME</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>
1. SAE 30W Non Detergent	<u>Naviguard/Peak</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case – 6 Quarts	\$483.73/dr \$19.58/6 1qt	BWE BWE

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID

1. LV ATF XT 10 QLV Mercon LV	<u>Peak</u> Price/Case – 6 Quarts	\$28.50	BWE
2. Dexron III Mercon Fluid	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case – 6 Quarts	\$516.25/dr \$36.78	BWE BWE
3. Dexron IV Mercon Fluid	<u>Naviguard/Peak</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case -6 Quarts	\$745.40/dr \$28.50/cs	BWE BWE
4. Dexron VI Mercon Fluid	<u>Naviguard/Peak</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum(411019) Price/Case -6 Qts (PVTS076)	\$745.40/dr \$28.50	BWE BWE
5. A.T. F. Multi-vehicle	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/Case – 12 Quarts (Peak)	\$516.25/dr \$36.78cs	BWE BWE
6. AGMA 8	<u>No Bid</u>		
7. Power Steering Fluid	<u>Pyroil</u> Price/Case – 12 Quarts	\$38.92/cs	BWE

UNIVERSAL GEAR LUBRICANTS

	<u>TRADE NAME</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>
MIL-L 2105 C, Hypoid Gear, API Service GL5			
1. SAE 80W -90 W API GL5	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/LB. 400 LB. Drum Price/LB. 35 LB. Pails	\$557.50/dr \$54.45/ea	BWE BWE
2. SAE 85W -140	<u>Naviguard (423040)</u> Price/LB. 35 LB. Pails	\$68.60/ea	BWE

MINERAL GEAR OIL

1. SAE 90	<u>Tuxton 90 GL-1</u> Price/5 Gallon Pail	\$60.00/ea	Superior
-----------	--	------------	----------

TRANSFORMER OIL

1. Shell Diala AX Transformer *No Substitutions	<u>Shell</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$1112.81/dr	BWE
---	--------------------------------------	--------------	-----

OTHER SNOWMOBILE, CHAIN SAW, MOWERS, CRANK CASE OILS

1. Two Cycle Engine Oil for mixing with gasoline	<u>Peak</u> Price/Case-6 Quarts	\$24.50/cs	BWE
2. Two Stroke Engine Oil XP Premium	<u>Quaker St</u> Price/Case 24-3.2 oz. Bottles	\$25.87	BWE
3. Chain Saw Bar Oil	<u>Naviguard (34-209NAVEXP)</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$346.50/dr	BWE
4. EMU Pump Oil	<u>No bid</u>		

HYDRAULIC OILS, RUST & OXIDATION INHIBITED & ANTIWEAR

	<u>TRADE NAME</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>
Hydraulic and hydrostatic systems) meets following manufacturers' specifications: Allis-Chalmers PF821, John Deere 303, J14B, J20A, IH Hytran Fluid, B-6 and other Similar products. Multipurpose Transmission Fluid (combination transmission – differential wet brake			
1. Tractor Fluid	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$505.75/dr	BWE
2. ISO 32	<u>Maxx Perf AW32</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$444.00/dr	Superior
3. ISO 46	<u>Maxx Perf AW46</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pails Bulk	\$447.00/dr \$44.00/ea \$7.40	Superior Superior Superior
4. ISO 32 Turbine, Regal Premium EP-Oil CHEVRON	<u>No Bid</u>		
5. ISO VG 22 High Viscosity Index Hydraulic Oil	<u>Maxx Perf AW22</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$499.00/dr	Superior

SYNTHETIC OILS

	<u>TRADE NAME</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>
1. Lubriplate 630AA	<u>Lubriplate</u> Price/120 Lb. Keg Price/24/14oz	\$683.77/ea \$312.65	BWE BWE
2. Lithium 000 Grease	<u>Gulf Crown 000</u> Price per 35 Lb. Pail	\$100.00/pail	Superior
3. Unocal EP2	<u>Gulfcrown EP-2</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pail	\$830.00/dr \$90.00ea	Superior Superior
4. 75W 90 Synthetic Gear Oil #7146	<u>Maxx Perf Syn 75w90</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pails Price/120# Kegs Price/Case 12Qts	\$1010.00dr \$98.00/ea \$340.00 \$83.00	Superior Superior Superior Superior
5. 80W 140 Synthetic Gear Oil #7145	<u>Maxx Perf 80w140/Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pails Price/120# Kegs	\$1180.00/dr \$115.00ea \$399.03/ea	Superior Superior BWE
6. Chevron Meropa 220 Gear Oil	<u>Naviguard</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$874.76/dr	BWE
7. Synthetic Oil for Compressors– Synthetic T-30	<u>No Bid</u>		

SYNTHETIC OILS

	<u>TRADE NAME</u>	<u>PRICE</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>
8.	Red Grease Cartridges (for hand grease gun) <u>Naviguard</u> Price/cs-10	\$2.946/ea	BWE
9..	Synthetic Bearing Grease14 Oz. Cartridge <u>Mobil</u> Price	\$6.15/ea	BWE
10..	EP-2 Grease Tubes 14.5 OZ. <u>Naviguard</u> Price/10	\$29.46	BWE
	Price/120 Lb. Keg	\$395.02/keg	BWE
11.	Mobil Synthetic Grease 10/14 Oz. Cartridge Pack <u>Mobil</u> Price/Cartridge Pack	\$61.50/pk	BWE
12.	Mobil SHC626 Oil *No Substitutions <u>Mobil</u> Price/5.5 Gallon Pails	\$223.20/ea	BWE/NOCO
13.	Mobil SHC629 *No Substitutions <u>Mobil</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum Price/5 Gallon Pails	\$2399.85/dr \$225.05/ea	BWE BWE
14.	Mobil DTE AA Compressor Oil <u>No bid</u>		
15.	Shell Morlina 53 BA15 Lubricating Oil <u>Mobil</u> Price/55 Gallon Drum	\$1233.00/dr	BWE
16.	Mobil Polyrex EM Series Blue Mobil Price/Carton-10 tubes	\$61.22	BWE