



**COUNTY OF ERIE
DIVISION OF PURCHASE
MEMORANDUM**

TO: All Requisitioners
FROM: Lorraine M. Kolb, Buyer
DATE: March 2022
SUBJECT: Compatible Toner Cartridges

Please be advised that the Division of Purchase has awarded the contract to cover the purchase of Compatible Toner Cartridges to **THREE Vendors**. The following information is provided to assist in processing requisitions. Term of pricing is 3-1-22 through 2-28-23.

The pricing pages are attached with the low bidder for that cartridge in **RED**. Only use the prices that are in **RED** as these are the awarded vendors' pricing.

For the return of the empty cartridges please contact the vendor who the purchase order was made out to. The contact person is listed in the vendor information. You will need to collect at least 5-10 cartridges before contacting the vendor. They will instruct you how to send the empty cartridges back to them.

Bid No.: 222072-005
Material Group: 207
Purchasing Group: 005
Terms-ALL Vendors: NET 30

Vendor Number: 115200
The Treehouse Inc
PO Box 413
Norwood MA 02062
Contract Person: David Rizzo
Email: djirizzo@aol.com
Phone: 800-595-6651

Vendor Number: 171990
BTEK Holdings LLC
1201 Gandy Blvd N Unit 22481
St Peterburg FL 33742

Contract Person: Bruce Banko
Email: bruce@btekhholdings.com
Phone: 844-267-7727 EXT 701

Vendor Number: 172139
AlphaB2B LLC
Db a Quality Imaging Solutions
2018 156th Avenue NE
Rellevue WA 98007

Contract Person: Heather Fotch
Email: heather.fotch@qualityimagingolutions.com
Phone: 888-866-3712 EXT 705

Term of Pricing: March 1, 2022 through February 28, 2023

Please feel free to contact me with any questions or problems regarding this contract at 858-6340.

lmk
Attachments

MANUFACTURER

PART

UNIT PRICE PER CARTRIDGE

MANUFACTURER	PART #	TREEHOUSE	BTEK HOLDINGS	ALPHAB2B
HEWLETT PACKARD	42A	\$30.75	\$48.00	\$43.99
	507A MAGENTA	\$26.00	\$58.00	\$58.99
	507A CYAN	\$26.00	\$58.00	\$58.99
	507A YELLOW	\$26.00	\$58.00	\$58.99
	507A BLACK	\$26.00	\$55.00	\$55.99
	95A TRI COLOR	\$6.50	\$11.94	\$7.99
	97A TRI COLOR	\$9.00	\$10.74	\$11.99
	98 BLACK	\$6.50	\$10.94	\$6.99
	99 PHOTO	\$8.00	\$9.94	Discontinued
	45A (51645A)	\$17.00	\$34.84	\$27.99
	4000TN	\$32.00(C4127X)	\$37.74	\$26.99
	B3P19A CYAN	\$70.40(OEM)	\$54.64	\$53.99
	B3P20A MAGENTA	\$70.40(OEM)	\$54.64	\$53.99
	B3P21A YELLOW	\$70.40(OEM)	\$54.64	\$53.99
	B3P23A PHOTO BLK	\$70.40(OEM)	\$54.64	\$53.99
	B3P24A GRAY	\$70.40(OEM)	\$54.64	\$53.99
	C2P04AN#140 (#62) BLK	\$27.00	\$16.97	\$13.99
	C2P06AN#140 TRI-COLOR	\$28.00	\$27.67	\$22.99
	C3903A (HP03A)	NO BID	\$31.28	Discontinued
	C3906A	\$16.00	\$28.78	Discontinued
	C4092A (HP92A)	\$15.00	\$29.50	\$23.99
	C4096A	\$26.00	\$36.55	\$26.99
	C4127X	\$32.00	\$35.79	\$26.99
	C4182X	\$67.00	\$53.29	\$48.99
	C4191A BLACK	NO BID	\$21.33	Discontinued
	C4192A CYAN	NO BID	\$21.33	Discontinued
	C4193A MAGENTA	NO BID	\$21.33	Discontinued
	C4194A YELLOW	NO BID	\$21.33	Discontinued
	C4820A (HP80)	NO BID	\$31.00	Not Available Reman
	C4820	NO BID	NO BID	Not Available Reman
	C4821	NO BID	NO BID	Not Available Reman
	C4821A	NO BID	NO BID	Not Available Reman
	C4822	NO BID	NO BID	Not Available Reman
	C4823	NO BID	NO BID	Not Available Reman
	C4846A (HP80)	NO BID	\$69.50	\$68.99
	C4847A (HP80)	NO BID	\$69.50	\$68.99
	C4871A (HP80)	NO BID	\$69.50	\$68.99
	C4906AN BLACK	\$6.50	\$10.55	\$13.99
	C4907AN CYAN	\$7.00	\$10.55	\$10.99
	C4908AN MAGENTA	\$7.00	\$10.55	\$10.99
	C4909AN YELLOW	\$7.00	\$10.55	\$10.99
	C51645A (#45)	\$17.00	\$29.90	\$27.99
C6578AN	\$17.00	\$18.28	Discontinued	
C6578DN (#78,#140)	\$16.00	\$21.78	\$17.99	
C6656AN (#56)	\$6.50	\$12.27	\$7.99	
C6657AN (#57)	\$12.00	\$17.58	\$12.99	
C6658AN (#58)	\$10.00	\$13.98	\$8.99	

MANUFACTURER

PART

UNIT PRICE PER CARTRIDGE

HEWLETT PACKARD

	TREEHOUSE	BTEK HOLDINGS	ALPHAB2B
C7115	\$11.50	\$28.82	\$22.99
C7115X (LJ1200)	\$13.00	\$29.80	\$23.99
C806X	\$32.00	\$39.78	NO BID
C8061A	\$31.00	\$38.79	\$27.99
C8061X	\$32.00	\$39.97	\$29.99
C8765WN (#94)	\$6.50	\$9.78	\$5.99
C8766WN (#95)	\$6.50	\$11.78	\$7.99
C8767WN (#96)	\$9.00	\$13.78	\$6.99
C92298 (#98)	\$35.00	\$29.78	Discontinued
C92298A (#98)	\$35.00	\$29.78	Discontinued
C9363WN (#97)	\$9.00	\$13.98	\$11.99
C9364WN#140	\$6.50	\$11.29	\$6.99
C9388A	NO BID	\$14.94	Discontinued
C9390A LIGHT CYAN	\$77.00(OEM)	\$49.79	\$54.99
C9391AN	\$7.00	\$14.94	Discontinued
C9392AN	\$7.00	\$14.94	Discontinued
C9393AN	\$7.00	\$14.94	Discontinued
C9396AN	\$8.00	\$16.94	Discontinued
C9403A (#72)	\$67.00(OEM)	\$50.74	\$51.99
C9448A MATTE BLACK	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9449A PHOTO BLACK	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9450 GRAY	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9451A LIGHT GRAY	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9452A CYAN	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9453A MAGENTA	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9454A YELLOW	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9455A LIGHT MAGENTA	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9458A MAGENTA	\$77.00(OEM)	\$52.00	\$54.99
C9701A (2500N)	\$29.00	\$49.74	\$44.99
C9702A (2500N)	\$29.00	\$49.74	\$44.99
C9720A BLACK	\$48.00	\$64.59	\$59.99
C9721A CYAN	\$49.00	\$64.59	\$55.99
C9722A YELLOW	\$49.00	\$64.59	\$59.99
C9723A MAGENTA	\$49.00	\$64.59	\$59.99
C9730A BLACK	\$71.00	\$78.63	\$76.99
C9731A CYAN	\$71.00	\$78.63	\$76.99
C9732A YELLOW	\$71.00	\$78.63	\$76.99
C9733A MAGENTA	\$71.00	\$78.63	\$76.99
C97301	NO BID	\$78.63	NO BID
CB317WN	\$6.00	\$16.78	NO BID
CB318WN CYAN	\$6.00	\$17.78	NO BID
CB319WN MAGENTA	\$6.00	\$17.78	NO BID
CB320WN YELLOW	\$6.00	\$17.78	NO BID
CB326WN BLACK	NO BID	\$17.78	NO BID

MANUFACTURER	PART #	UNIT PRICE PER CARTRIDGE		
		TREEHOUSE	BTEK HOLDINGS	ALPHAB2B
HEWLETT PACKARD	CB400A	\$67.00	\$59.29	\$54.99
	CB401A	\$57.00	\$59.29	\$54.99
	CB403A	\$57.00	\$59.29	\$54.99
	CB540A BLACK	\$12.50	\$34.78	\$25.99
	CB541A CYAN	\$12.50	\$34.78	\$25.99
	CB542A YELLOW	\$12.50	\$34.78	\$25.99
	CB543A MAGENTA	\$12.50	\$34.78	\$25.99
	CB CC364A	\$23.00	\$56.48	\$56.99
	CC364X	\$30.00	\$66.48	\$67.99
	CC635A (#701)	\$12.50	NO BID	\$11.99
	CC640WN BLACK	\$14.00	\$17.51	\$13.99
	CC641 WN (60XL)	\$15.00	\$21.79	\$19.99
	CE255A (P3015)	\$20.00	\$49.79	\$48.99
	CE270A (CP5525N)	\$58.00	\$78.98	\$75.99
	CE271A CYAN	\$58.00	\$89.28	\$88.99
	CE272A YELLOW	\$58.00	\$89.28	\$88.99
	CE273A MAGENTA	\$58.00	\$89.28	\$88.99
	CE278A	\$7.00	\$32.28	\$26.99
	CE278AR	\$7.00	NO BID	\$34.99
	CE285A	\$7.00	\$31.78	\$26.99
	CE301A	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.99
	CE314A	\$36.00	\$47.28	\$42.99
	CE390A	\$24.00	\$56.67	\$56.99
	CE400X	\$26.00	\$61.78	\$56.99
	CE 401A	\$26.00	\$58.89	\$54.99
	CE402A	\$26.00	\$58.89	\$54.99
	CE403A	\$26.00	\$58.89	\$54.99
	CE410AR	\$12.00	\$34.99	\$29.99
	CF226X	\$18.00	\$69.98	\$47.99
	CF230A	\$16.00	\$36.18	\$31.99
	CF258X	\$146.00(OEM)	\$98.89	\$102.99
	CF280A	\$11.00	\$34.87	\$27.99
	CF350A	\$15.00	\$38.87	\$32.99
	CF351A	\$13.50	\$37.87	\$32.99
	CF352A	\$13.50	\$37.87	\$32.99
	CF353A	\$13.50	\$37.87	\$32.99
	CF400A	\$17.00	\$41.79	\$41.99
	CF401A	\$20.50	\$48.79	\$46.99
	CF402A	\$20.50	\$48.79	\$46.99
	CF403A	\$20.50	\$48.79	\$46.99
CF410X BLACK	\$16.50	\$54.48	\$52.99	
CF411A CYAN	\$16.50	\$56.48	\$53.99	
CF412A YELLOW	\$16.50	\$56.48	\$53.99	
CF413A MAGENTA	\$16.50	\$56.48	\$53.99	
CT3903A	NO BID	\$52.49	Discontinued	
CT3906A	\$16.00	\$29.78	Discontinued	
CT3909A	\$62.00	\$51.29	\$45.99	

MANUFACTURER

PART

UNIT PRICE PER CARTRIDGE

HEWLETT PACKARD

	TREEHOUSE	BTEK HOLDINGS	ALPHAB2B
CT4092A	\$15.00	\$32.58	\$23.99
CT4096A	\$26.00	\$38.55	\$26.99
CT4127X	\$32.00	\$37.88	\$26.99
CT4129X	\$38.00	\$45.89	\$39.99
CT6511XC	\$42.00	\$47.84	\$44.99
CT7115X (#15A)	\$13.00	\$31.79	\$23.99
CT8061A	\$31.00	\$39.98	\$27.99
CT8061XC	\$32.00	\$40.79	\$29.99
CTCC530A	\$13.00	\$39.94	\$33.99
CTCC531A	\$13.00	\$39.94	\$33.99
CTCC532A	\$13.00	\$39.94	\$33.99
CTCC533A	\$13.00	\$39.94	\$33.99
CTCC364A	\$23.00	\$56.58	\$56.99
CTCE278A	\$7.00	\$33.34	\$26.99
CTCE285A	\$7.00	\$32.49	\$26.99
CTCE310A	\$13.00	\$36.29	Duplicate ?
CTCE390A	\$24.00	\$58.67	\$56.99
CTCE410A	\$12.00	\$35.98	\$29.99
CTCE410X	\$13.00	\$41.58	\$52.99
CTCE411A (CYAN)	\$12.50	\$37.54	\$53.99
CTCE412A (YELLOW)	\$12.50	\$37.54	\$53.99
CTCE413A (MAGENTA)	\$12.50	\$37.54	\$53.99
CTCE505X (LJ2055)	\$13.00	\$34.79	\$38.99
CTCF210A	\$12.50	\$36.28	\$28.99
CTCF211A	\$11.00	\$38.28	\$31.99
CTCF212A	\$11.00	\$38.28	\$31.99
CTCF213A	\$11.00	\$38.28	\$31.99
CTCF226X	\$18.00	\$68.89	\$47.99
CTCF280X	\$13.00	\$49.29	\$27.99
CTCF281	\$25.00	\$58.29	\$58.99
CTCF28A	NO BID	\$35.28	NO BID
CTCF283A	\$8.00	\$32.88	\$27.99
CTFX7	\$40.00	\$39.79	NO BID
CTQ2612A (LJ1012)	\$8.00	\$29.98	\$22.99
CTQ5945X	\$27.00	\$66.29	\$59.99
CTQ6460A	\$84.00	\$76.74	\$75.99
CTQ6461A	\$84.00	\$79.74	\$75.99
CTQ6462A	\$84.00	\$79.74	\$75.99
CTQ6463A	\$84.00	\$79.74	\$75.99
CT7115X	\$13.00	\$29.80	\$23.99
LJ1200	\$13.00C7115X	\$29.80	\$23.99
LJ1320	\$11.00Q5949A	\$34.88	\$27.99
LJ4050	\$32.00C4127X	\$38.58	Duplicate ?
LJFX3	\$16.00	\$37.92	NO BID
LJ7115X	\$13.00C7115X	\$29.80	\$23.99
LJP505N	\$8.00CB436A	\$32.58	\$26.99

MANUFACTURER	PART #	UNIT PRICE PER CARTRIDGE		
HEWLETT PACKARD	LJM225DN	TREEHOUSE \$8.00	BTEK HOLDINGS CF283A \$32.98	ALPHAB2B \$27.99
	Q1338A	\$27.00	\$52.57	\$45.99
	Q2610A	\$21.00	\$37.24	\$29.99
	Q2612A	\$8.00	\$30.00	Duplicate ?
	Q2613X	\$15.00	\$35.58	\$27.99
	Q4096A	\$26.00	\$38.59	\$26.99
	Q5942A	\$30.75	\$49.29	\$43.99
	Q5945X	\$27.00	\$65.79	\$59.99
	Q5951A	\$85.00	\$65.74	\$61.99
	Q6000A	\$25.00	\$48.69	\$36.99
	Q6001A	\$25.00	\$48.69	\$36.99
	Q6002A	\$25.00	\$48.69	\$36.99
	Q6003A	\$25.00	\$48.69	\$36.99
	Q6470A	\$42.00	\$55.79	\$50.99
		OEM\$107.50	NO BID	NO BID
	Q6471A CYAN	\$42.00	\$55.79	\$51.99
		OEM\$107.50	NO BID	NO BID
	Q6472A YELLOW	\$42.00	\$55.79	\$51.99
		OEM\$107.50	NO BID	NO BID
	Q6473A MAGENTA	\$42.00	\$55.79	\$51.99
		OEM\$107.50	NO BID	NO BID
	Q6511A	\$34.00	\$42.97	\$36.99
	Q7551X	\$21.00	\$48.72	\$45.99
	RM7115A	\$11.50	\$30.98	\$23.99
	RM9364WN	\$6.50	\$11.14	\$6.99
	RMCD975AN	\$7.00	\$13.29	\$9.99
	RMCH563WN	\$17.00	\$26.87	\$18.99
	RMCH563WN140	\$17.00	\$26.87	\$18.99
	RMCH564WN			
		(HP61XL) \$18.00	\$29.59	\$21.99
	RMCH565WN (HP61)	NO BID	\$28.69	NO BID
	RMCH634AN (HP920)	\$6.00	\$14.95	NO BID
	RMCH635AN (HP920)	\$6.00	\$14.95	NO BID
	RMCH636AN (HP920)	\$6.00	\$14.95	NO BID
	HP M254 COLOR			
		TONER 202A NO BID	\$138.79	NO BID
	CHROMALIFE100 8 COLOR MULTI PACK		NO BID	\$52.69
			NO BID	

MANUFACTURER	PART #	UNIT PRICE PER CARTRIDGE		
BROTHER		TREEHOUSE	BTEK HOLDINGS	ALPHAB2B
	2820	\$10.50	TN350 \$28.79	\$31.99
	CT350 (INTELLIFAX 2820)	\$10.50	\$28.79	\$20.99
	S1TN110 BLACK	\$16.00	\$25.68	Discontinued
	S1TN110C CYAN	\$14.00	\$25.68	Discontinued
	S1TN110Y YELLOW	\$14.00	\$25.68	Discontinued
	S1TB110M MAGENTA	\$14.00	\$25.68	Discontinued
	TB460R	\$16.00	\$29.09	\$20.99
	TN200HL	NO BID	\$17.74	\$6.99
	TN310CYAN	\$13.00	\$38.09	Duplicate?
	TN310MAGENTA	\$13.00	\$38.09	Duplicate ?
	TN310YELLOW	\$13.00	\$38.09	Duplicate
	TN330	\$8.50	\$27.99	\$20.99
	TN350	\$10.50	\$28.99	\$32.99
	TN420	\$7.50	\$28.88	\$22.99
	TN430	\$12.00	\$29.09	\$21.99
	TN450	\$8.00	\$29.89	\$21.99
	TN460	\$16.00	\$29.89	Duplicate ?
	TN460R	\$16.00	\$29.89	Duplicate ?
	CANON	FX3	\$16.00	\$32.78
FX4		\$30.00	\$49.59	\$24.99
FX7		\$40.00	\$39.79	\$29.99
PCLI-8C		NO BID	\$11.79	\$3.99
PCLI-8M		NO BID	\$11.79	\$3.99
PCLI-8Y		NO BID	\$11.79	\$3.99
PCLI-8BK		NO BID	\$12.79	\$4.99
051H HIGH YIELD		\$23.00	\$46.79(051 ONLY)	\$51.99
051 DRUM CARTRIDGE		NO BID	\$129.00(OEM)	NO BID
DELL	1320C	\$32.00	\$76.79	SOLD Seperately
	4 PK INCLUDES BLACK/CYAN/MAGENTA/YELLOW SEPARATETLY:			
	CT3109058 BLACK	\$8.00	\$21.79	\$14.99
	CT3109060 CYAN	\$8.00	\$21.79	\$14.99
	CT3109062 YELLOW	\$8.00	\$21.79	\$14.99
	CT3109064 MAGENTA	\$8.00	\$21.79	\$14.99
	CT3302209 (DELL2335DN)	\$19.00	\$46.89	\$45.99
	CT3302666	\$45.00	\$61.74	\$64.99
EPSON	LQ590	NO BID	\$14.59(OEM) \$4.99	
IBM	CT75P4303	\$95.00	\$69.79 \$64.99	