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This is to advise you that there is a new contract for Auto and Truck Lubricants. The contract is good from
June 1, 2024 through November 30, 2024.

No additional freight charges or fuel surcharges will be allowed.

For your convenience I have listed the pricing information on the attached sheets.



AUTO AND TRUCK LUBRICANTS
Bid #240147-004- June 1, 2024 through November 30, 2024

MATERIAL GROUP: 060, PURCHASING GROUP #004

VENDOR INFORMATION: SAFETY KLEEN SYSTEMS Al5 16>
41 North Gate Ave.
Lackawanna, NY 14217
Telephone #716-826-8931
Fax #716-826-8933

NOCO ENVIRONMENTAL - Vendor # 17824
2440 Sheridan Dr..
Tonawanda, NY 14150
Telephone #716-614-6626

SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS-Vendor#108483
32 Ward Road
North Tonawanda, NY 14120
Telephone #693-8412
Fax #695-9087
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HEAVY DUTY DIESEL ENGINE OILS

TRADE NAME PRICE VENDOR

1. SAE 15W- 40 API SN/CJ4, MIL-L 2104 D Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $574.75/dr Noco

2. SAE 30W - API SJ/CD Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $594.00/dr Noco

3. SAE 40W API SJ/CD Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $638.00/dr Noco

4. SAE 15W 40 Chevron Delo 400 Multigrade Maxx Pert 15w40
Price/55 Gallon Drum $604.10/dr Superior

GASOLINE ENGINES, LIGHT DUTY DIESEL ENGINES

1. SAE 5W-30 API SN/CC Max_Perf Synblend5w30
Price/55 Gallon Drum ) $472.50/dr Superior
Price/5 Gallon Pails $47.50/ea Superior
Price/case 6qts $19.50/cs Superior

2. SAE 10W-30 API SN/CC MIL-L46152B Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $445.00/dr Noco

3. SAE 10W-30 CJ4 Semi Synthetic Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $605.00/dr Noco

4. SAE 10W-40 API SN/CC, MIL-L46152B Maxx Pert 1 0w40
Price/55 Gallon Drum $501.50/dr Superior
Price/5 Gallon Pails $99.50/ea Superior
Price/Case - 6 Quarts $20.50/6 cs Superior

5. SAE 30W API SJ/CD 55 Gallon Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $605.00/dr Noco

6. SAE 5W-40 Synthetic CJ4 MaxxPerf Syn5w4Q/Gulf
Price/55 Gallon Drum $1056.50dr Superior
Price/5 Gallon Pail $99.50 Superior
Price/Case 6 Quarts $33.50 Superior

7. SAE 5W-20 API SN/CE Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum $440.00/dr Noco

8. SAE 0W-20 Full SYN DEXSO1 Maxx Pert dexos Gen3
Price/55 Gallon Drum $671.50/dr Superior
Price/12 Qts (65611) $47.00 Superior

9. SAE 5W-20 Full SYN DEXSO1 Safety Kleen
Price/55 Gallon Drum $604.15/dr Safety Kleen
Price/Case 6 Quarts $39.25 Safety Kleen

10. SAE 5W-30 Full SYN DEXSO1 Gen2 Safety Kleen
Price/55 Gallon Drum $629.84/dr Safety Kleen
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NON-DETERGENT PRODUCTS

TRADE NAME
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PRICE VENDOR

1. SAE 30W Non Detergent

2. Dexron Ill Mercan Fluid

5. A.T. F. Multi-vehicle

6. AGMA8

Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID

Maxx Perf MP ATF
Price/55 Gallon Drum

Price/Case - 6 Quarts

Performance Plus
Price/55 Gallon Drum
Price/Case - 12 Quarts (Peak)

NO BID

UNIVERSAL GEAR LUBRICANTS

$500.00/dr

$522.50/dr

$33.75

$800.00/dr
$50.00cs

Noco

Superior

Superior

Safety Kleen
Safety Kleen

MIL-L 2105 C, Hypoid Gear, API Service GL5

1. SAE 80W -90 W API GL5

2. SAE 85W-140

1. SAE 90

TRADE NAME

Maxx Pert 80w90
Price/LB. 400 LB. Drum
Price/LB. 35 LB. Pails

Maxx Pert 85w140
Price/LB. 35 LB. Pails

MINERAL GEAR OIL

Tuxton 90 GL-1
Price/5 Gallon Pail

TRANSFORMER OIL

PRICE

$679.00/dr
$66.50/ea

$67.50/ea

$63.50/ea

VENDOR

Superior
Superior

Superior

Superior

1. Shell Diala AX Transformer *No Substitutions
NO BID
Price/SS Gallon Drum
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HYDRAULIC OILS, RUST & OXIDATION INHIBITED & ANTIWEAR
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TRADE NAME PRICE VENDOR

Hydraulic and hydrostatic systems) meets following manufacturers' specifications:
Allis-Chalmers PF821, John Deere 303, J14B, J20A, IH Hytran Fluid, B-6 and other
Similar products.
Multipurpose Transmission Fluid (combination transmission - differential wet brake

1. Tractor Fluid

2. ISO 32

3. ISO 46

Maxx Pert Tractor Fluid
Price/55 Gallon Drum

Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum

Noco
Price/55 Gallon Drum
Price/5 Gallon Pails
Bulk

$531.50/dr

$413.00/dr

$418.00/dr
$44.00/ea
$6.36/gal

Superior

Noco

Noco
Noco
Noco

4. ISO 32 Turbine, Regal Premium EP-Oil CHEVRON
No bid

Price/55 Gallon Drum

5. ISO VG 22 High Viscosity Index Hydraulic Oil
Noco

Price/55 Gallon Drum

SYNTHETIC OILS

TRADE NAME

$765.00/dr

PRICE

Noco

VENDOR

1. Lubruplate 630AA Lubriplate
Price/120 Lb. Keg $860.00/ea Superior

2. Lithium 000 Grease Gulf Crown EP-000
Price per 35 Lb. Pail $131.50/pail Superior

3. Unocal EP2 Gulfcrown EP-2
Price/55 Gallon Drum $1090.50/dr Superior
Price/5 Gallon Pail $107.55ea Superior

4. 75W 90 Synthetic Gear Oil #7146 MaxxPerf Syn5w90
Price/55 Gallon Drum $1006.50dr Superior
Price/5 Gallon Pails $99.50/ea Superior
Price/120# Kegs $330.00 Superior
Price/Case 12Qts $70.00 Superior
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5. 80W 140 Synthetic Gear Oil #7145 Maxx Pert 80w140
Price/55 Gallon Drum $1111.00/dr Superior
Price/5 Gallon Pails $111.50ea Superior
Price/120# Kegs $366.00/ea Superior

6. Chevron Meropa 220 Gear Oil No bid
Price/55 Gallon Drum

7. Mobilgear 600xp220 Gear oil
Maxx Perf EP-220
Price/55 Gallon Drum $675.00/ea Superior

8. Synthetic Oil for Compressors- Synthetic T-30
No bid
Price/55 Gallon Drum
Price/5 Gallon Pails

9 Red Grease Cartridges (for hand grease gun)
No bid
Pricelcs-10

10.. Synthetic Bearing Grease14 Oz. Cartridge
No bid

11.. EP-2 Grease Tubes 14.5 OZ. Gulfcrown EP-2 $43.00 Superior

Price/120 Lb. Keg $355.00/keg Superior

12. Mobil Synthetic Grease No Bid
10/14 Oz. Cartridge Pack Price/Cartridge Pack

13. Mobil SHC626 Oil *No Substitutions No Bid

14. Mobil SHC629 *No Substitutions No Bid
Price/55 Gallon Drum
Price/5 Gallon Pails

15. Mobil DTE AA Compressor Oil No Bid
Price/5 Gallon Pails

16. Shell Morii na 53 BA15 Lubricating Oil No Bid
Price/55 Gallon Drum

17. Mobil Polyrex EM Series Blue No Bid
Price/carton 1 O tubes


