

322100

Bid Summary Sheet

Date 9/9/24

Opening Date 9/24/24

Buyer JMK

Time 2:30 a.m./p.m.

Collective Bid # 240235-005

Delivery Date \_\_\_\_\_

Bid Title Paper Requirements 4<sup>th</sup> Quarter

Formal  Informal

Advertised on 9/13/24

Req# Various PO# \_\_\_\_\_

Bid Bond Required

Insurance Required

Perf. Bond Required

Vendor #	Vendor Name	RFQ#	Response
1. <u>109602</u>	<u>Eaton's office</u>	<u>60000</u>	<u>T.dimuzio...</u>
2. <u>109611</u>	<u>Uyo / dut /</u>	<u>60000</u>	<u>uyo1@uyo1.com</u>
3. <u>109324</u>	<u>WB Mason</u>	<u>60000</u>	<u>rebeca.mendezvelazquez@wbmason.com</u>
4. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____
5. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____
6. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____
7. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____
8. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____
9. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____
10. _____	_____	<u>60000</u>	_____

Awarded to Vendor No. 1  
2  
3

Items(s) 4V  
1R.V,  
{2+3 RAV, 4R,  
5R, + 6R}

- Checklist:
- Pink Sheet Completed-Signed & Dated
  - Green Summary Sheet w/Signatures if Applicable
  - All Bids w/Envelopes Attached
  - Internet Hits
  - Formal Log Sheet
  - POSTED ONLINE

Reason for Award:  Low Bid  Other

REV. 2/21

Remarks: \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

BUYER JMK

Date 9/26/24

**BID SPECIFICATIONS**

FOLLOWING ARE ESTIMATED 4TH QUARTER REQUIREMENTS

109611

109324

1	EST. QTY	U/M	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE PER "T"	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
1	22,490	T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE 8 1/2" X 11" BOND PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON <b>RECYCLED WHITE STOCK</b> <b>VIRGIN PAPER WHITE STOCK</b>	Eaton's oss. No Bid \$36.75/ctn	Uyo 1 \$37.50/ctn \$33.50/ctn	W B Mason \$37.80/ctn \$33.60/ctn
2	680	T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 8 1/2" X 14" BOND PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON <b>RECYCLED WHITE STOCK</b> <b>VIRGIN PAPER WHITE STOCK</b>	No Bid \$65.00/ctn	No Bid No Bid	\$102.00/ctn \$58.30/ctn
3	307	T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 11" X 17" BOND PACKED 2.5T SHEETS PER CARTON. <b>RECYCLED WHITE STOCK</b> <b>VIRGIN PAPER WHITE STOCK</b>	No Bid \$52.50/ctn	No Bid No Bid	\$49.00/ctn \$46.75/ctn
4	1,620	T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 8 1/2" X 11" BOND PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON. <b>RECYCLED COLOR STOCK - STANDARD COLORS</b> <b>VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK STANDARD COLORS</b>	No Bid \$53.20/ctn	No Bid No Bid	\$54.50/ctn \$54.50/ctn
5	375	T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 8 1/2" X 14" BOND PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON <b>RECYCLED COLOR STOCK - STANDARD COLORS</b> <b>VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK STANDARD COLORS</b>	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid \$99.40/ctn

NOTE: IF CARTON PACKING IS DIFFERENT THAN NUMBER OF SHEETS PER CARTON INDICATED ABOVE, PLEASE INDICATE THE QUANTITY.

NAME OF BIDDER \_\_\_\_\_

**BID SPECIFICATIONS**

OLLOWING ARE ESTIMATED 4TH QUARTER REQUIREMENTS

EST. QTY	U/M	DESCRIPTION	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
			Eaton's OSS	Unpl	WB Mason
430	T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 11" X 17" BOND PACKED 2.5T SHEETS PER CARTON. <b>RECYCLED COLOR STOCK - STANDARD COLORS</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		<b>VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK STANDARD COLORS</b>	No Bid	No Bid	\$79.50/ctn
1	T	SHEETS 24# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 8 1/2" X 11" PACKED 4T PER CARTON <b>RECYCLED COLOR STOCK</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		<b>VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1	T	SHEETS 24# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 11" X 17" BOND PACKED 2.5T SHEETS PER CARTON. <b>RECYCLED COLOR STOCK.</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		<b>VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		ADDITIONAL COST FOR THREE HOLE PUNCH PER "T" FOR ITEM NUMBERS 1 - 8:			
		_____ (8 1/2" X 11")	No Bid	\$7.50/T	\$20.00/T
		_____ (8 1/2" X 14")	No Bid	—	\$25.00/T

CARTON PACKING IS DIFFERENT THAN NUMBER OF SHEETS PER CARTON INDICATED ABOVE, PLEASE INDICATE THE QUANTITY.