

A1102-25 Quarterly Erasable Wall Organizer	\$16.72
AAG-d6099705 Harmony Colorful Compact Monthly Desk Pad, 17 7/8" x 10 7/8"	NO BID
AAG-E71250-25 Burkhart's Day Calendar	\$47.62
AAG-E517-50 Quick Note Refill	\$10.03
AAG-E717-50 Daily Desk Refill	\$2.21
AAG-E717T-50	\$5.64
AAG-E19-00 Plastic Base	\$15.87
AAG-E919-50 Compact Daily Desk Refill	\$9.97
AAG-G100-00	\$12.60
AAG-G200-00 Weekly Appt Book	\$9.29
AAG-G210-00 Weekly Appt Book	\$14.73
AAG-G250-00 Weekly Pocket Non-Refill	\$12.70
AAG-G250000 Desk Pad	NO BID
AAG-G400-00 Monthly Planner	\$10.19
AAG-G450-00 Day Minder Monthly Planner	NO BID
AAG-G470-00 Day Minder Monthly Planner	\$10.97
AAG-G520-00 Weekly Prof. Appt. Book	\$14.08
AAG-G52007 Dayminder Weekly/Monthly Appt Book Plannter, 8 1/2" x 11", Gray	NO BID
AAG-G520-H00 Premier Weekly Appt Book	\$24.09
AAG-G545-00 Executive Weekly/Monthly Planner	\$42.39
AAG-G545-50 Executive Weekly/Monthly Planner	\$19.19
AAG-G546-00 Dayminder Executive Weekly	NO BID
AAG-G560-00	\$42.13
AAG-G590-00 Weekly Planner Open Schedule	\$12.89
AAG-K100	\$28.21
AAG-PM2-28 1 Month Per Page	\$8.62
AAG-PM4-28 Monthly Wall Calendar	\$16.03
AAG-PM1-28 Montly Wall Calendar 8"x11" 12 Months	\$6.38
AAG-PM11-28	\$13.62
AAG-PM12820	\$8.07
AAG-PM12-28-25 Wall Calendar Reversible Vertical/Horz.	\$9.86
AAG-PM14-28	\$14.75
AAG-PM17028 Wirebound Monthly Desk/Wall Calendar	\$8.22
AAG-PM26-28 Vertical/Horz. Erasable Wall Calendar	\$15.70
AAG-PM212-28 Vertical/Horz. Paper Wall Calendar	\$10.90
AAG-PM333-28 30/60 Day Undated Horizontal Wall Planner	\$27.92
AAG-PM428-25 Wall Monthly	\$20.08
AAG-PM91707 Watercolors Recycled Monthly Wall Calendar	\$13.35
AAG-PML03-28 Monthly Erasable Wall Calendar	\$21.91
AAG-R17-00 Plastic Base	NO BID
AAG-035-05 Weekly planner Unruled	\$10.43
AAG-70-100-P-05 Weekly Appt. Book Plus	NO BID
AAG-7012413 Fashion Monthly Planner, 1 Month Double Page, 6 7/8" x 8 3/4" Wire Bound, Red	NO BID
NAME OF BIDDER	Eaton Office Supply Co., Inc.

er	17.47
	Disc. - No Replacement
	34.94
	7.43
	1.94
	5.97
	12.07
	8.23
	12.40
	9.68
	7.83
	7.07
	7.43
	7.66
	Disc. - suggest AAGSK5300
	4.35
	8.46
	10.63
Appt	Disc. - suggest AAGG52014
	18.31
	18.44
lanner	33.79
lanner	16.22
	18.16
	31.61
ule	12.29
	24.28
	7.83
	16.85
2 Months	6.58
	11.61
	6.58
Vertical/Horz.	11.45
	11.46
all Calendar	6.40
Calendar	17.52
alendar	12.62
tal Wall Planner	21.26
	16.85
ily Wall Calendar	10.59
ndar	15.84
	4.45
	9.91
	Disc. - suggest AAG7010005
	15.71
ire Bound, Red	Disc. - suggest AAG7012420
WB Mason	25.66
	Blue

CALENDAR PRICING FOR 2025

BID PRICE FOR 1 EACH

BID PRICE FOR 1 EACH

AAG-70-260-05 Monthly Planner, 15 Month 8 7/8" x 11", Unruled Blocks, Black	<u>\$14.20</u>
AAG-70-260G05	<u>\$19.56</u>
AAG-70-290-05	<u>\$26.03</u>
AAG-70620605 Plan, Write, Remember Monthly Planner & Notebook 9 1/4" x 11"	<u>NO BID</u>
AAG-70-865P-05 Weekly Appt. Book Plus	<u>\$18.87</u>
AAG-70-950-05 Weekly Appt. Book/Planner 13 Months, Black 8 1/4" x 10 7/8" Black	<u>\$18.39</u>
AAG-70-950V-05	<u>\$29.61</u>
AAG-70-1111-05 Weekly Mo Small Pocket Diary	<u>NO BID</u>
AAG-70-EPO1-05-25 Planner Weekly	<u>NO BID</u>
AAG-70-EP04-05 Action Planner Daily Appt. Book	<u>NO BID</u>
AAG-76-01-05 Quick Notes	<u>\$27.59</u>
AAG-76-02-05 Quick Notes Weekly/Monthly Appointment Book 4 7/8" x 8" Black	<u>\$20.16</u>
AAG-76-04-05	<u>\$25.52</u>
AAG-76-06-05 Quick Notes Monthly Planner	<u>\$21.06</u>
AAG-76-08-05 Quick Notes Monthly Planner 6 7/8" x 8 3/4", Black	<u>\$20.74</u>
AAG-865P-05 Weekly Appt. Book	<u>NO BID</u>
AAG-897-01	<u>\$17.27</u>
AAG-AW-4010-28 Wallmates Dry Erase Open	<u>NO BID</u>
AAG-AW-5020-28 Wallmates Dry Erase Open	<u>NO BID</u>
HOD1506 Recycled Two-Color Monthly Desk Pad Calendar	<u>\$6.90</u>
K1-50 Today is Refill	<u>\$13.31</u>
PMLM03-28	<u>\$21.91</u>
SD374-25 Daily Bus. Diary	<u>\$62.38</u>
SD376-25 Daily Diary	<u>\$72.64</u>
SD385-25 Daily Diary - No Bids	<u>NO BID</u>
SD387-25 Standard Diary Daily Reminder	<u>\$31.69</u>
SD389-25 Daily Diary	<u>\$32.13</u>
SK16-25 Monthly Desk/Wall Calendar	<u>NO BID</u>
SK22-00 Blot Set	<u>\$24.71</u>
SK22-50 Blot Set Refill No Bids	<u>NO BID</u>
SK24-00 Desk Blotter 17 x 22	<u>\$3.94</u>
SK25-25	<u>NO BID</u>
SK30-00 Desk Blotter 19 x 24	<u>NO BID</u>
SK44-00 Daily Appt Book	<u>\$11.70</u>
SK48-00	<u>\$7.38</u>
SK200-24 Monthly Planner	<u>\$9.79</u>
SK700-24	<u>NO BID</u>
SK-800 Desk Wall Calendar	<u>\$7.74</u>
SO200-24	<u>NO BID</u>
SW-700X0021 Flip a Week	<u>\$22.10</u>
SW-705X50 Flip a Week	<u>\$11.07</u>
NAME OF BIDDER	<u>Eaton Office Supply Co., Inc.</u>

14.83
<u>16.89</u>
<u>23.57</u>
Monthly
Disc. - suggest AAG 706209 05 <u>\$12.38</u>
Disc. - suggest AAG 7086505 <u>\$17.11</u>
19.23
<u>25.58</u>
<u>13.22</u>
<u>31.04</u>
pt. Book Disc. - suggest AAG 760405 <u>\$22.11</u>
<u>27.18</u>
16.96
<u>22.11</u>
21.13
<u>18.43</u>
Disc. - suggest AAG 7086505 <u>\$17.11</u>
<u>13.51</u>
pen Disc. - suggest AAG SW 402028 <u>\$9.86</u>
pen <u>14.41</u>
Desk Pad Calendar <u>5.16</u>
15.42
<u>15.84</u>
<u>51.10</u>
<u>49.82</u>
Disc. - No Replacement
<u>20.27</u>
<u>16.22</u>
<u>5.89</u>
<u>20.06</u>
Disc. - No Replacement
<u>3.24</u>
Disc. - suggest H0012440 <u>\$10.55</u>
<u>18.61</u>
<u>12.91</u>
<u>5.75</u>
<u>7.94</u>
Disc. - suggest AAG AY828 <u>\$10.38</u>
<u>7.74</u>
<u>10.29</u>
<u>17.51</u>
<u>8.56</u>
<u>WB MASON</u>

CALENDAR PRICING FOR 2025