
COUNTY OF ERIE

DIVISION OF PURCHASE

TO: ALL USING DEPARTMENTS

FROM: Tricia Pierce, Buyer

DATE: January 2, 2025

SUBJECT: BID FOR TOWING SERVICES
BID NO.: 230284-004
TERM: December 1, 2023- November 30, 2025

+++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++++
+
This is to advise you that the bid for "TOWINGSERVICES"has been extended The bidpricing is good
through 11/30/2025.
The services provided in this contract include Towing ,Battery Service either jump start or replacement, Tire
Changing, Lock Out Service and Fuel Delivery. These services will be available on a 24/7/365 basis. Please
use the vendor that services your location with the lowest price for the service you need.

For your convenience I have listed the vendor information on the attached sheets.



Page 2
BID NO.: 230284-004
TOWING SERVICES

VENDOR: Al Enterprises of WNY Inc ..- Vendor #173262
11075 Walden Ave.
Alden, NY 14004
Telephone #716-818-6229

VENDOR: Auto Wrench Connection- Vendor #162272
2 Mill St.
Gowanda, NY 14070
Telephone #716-532-3875

VENDOR: Dadswell Service Inc..- Vendor #110575
8490 Main Street
Williamsville, NY 14221
Telephone #633-7276

VENDOR: Marty's Towing- Vendor #110947
1741 Baseline Rd.
Grand Island, NY 14072
Telephone #716-773-3515

VENDOR: Merj Fleet Services, Inc. - Vendor #165055
1989 Harlem Road
Buffalo, NY 14212
Telephone #716-604-2300

VENDOR: Smokey's Towing- Vendor #145253
1760 West Ave.
Marilla, NY 14102
Telephone #359-2457

VENDOR: Transit Towing- Vendor #170565
2021 Transit Rd.
Elma, NY 14059
Telephone #716-359-3366

District #1-Northwest includes Grand Island, Kenmore, Tonawanda, Amherst, Williamsville, City of Buffalo,
Cheektowaga,Lackawanna and West Seneca

District #2.-Northeast includes Clarence, Newstead, Alden, Lancaster, Depew, Elma, Marilla

District #3 - Southwest includes Blasdell, Hamburg, Orchard Park, Boston, Eden, Evans, Brant and Collins

District #4 - Southeast includes Aurora, East Aurora, Holland, Wales, West Falls, Sardinia and Concord



"T

1
$100.00/ea
No Bid

Smokey's 'Transit Tow AutoWrench
$100.00lea $6o.00lea $250.00lea
$140.00/ea $120.00lea $275.00lea
No Bid $190.00/hr No bid
$100.00lea $70.00lea $250.00lea
$140.00/ea $120.00lea $275.00lea
No Bid $190.00/hr No bid- - -
$3.00/ea $2.00/ea $5.00
$3.00lea $2.00lea $5,00
No Bid , $2.00/ea No bid
$80.00/ea $70.00 $65.00lea
$80.00lea $80.00 $75.00/ea
No bid no bid No bid
No Bid $70.00 $65.00lea
No Bid $90.00 $75.00/ea
No Bid $90.00/hr No bid

$70.00 $65.00/ea
$80.00 $75.00lea

No Bid no bid I No bid
$90.00/ea $70.00 $65.00/ea
t f 4

$90.00/ea $70.00 $75.00/ea
No Bid' t s7o.0oNo bid

1$100.00lhr $à5.00 ·$150.00/hr
$125.00/hr $95.00 ~175.00/hr
No Bid 1 $165.00 No bid
~O.OO+fu~I

1
$60.00+fuel _$65.00+fuel

1 District #1

iDi_!t~ict #2 ¡istrict #2 Tt. District #3 --
District #3 District #3- ---
District #4 District #4

A1
1
$125.00/ea

I
' $185.00lhr
$245.00/hr
$125.00/ea
$185.00/hr

I
$245.00/hr
$5.50/ea

I
port to port
port to port
$100.O0/hr
$125.00lhr
$150.00/hr
$100.00/hr
$125.00lhr
$150.00/hr
$100.00/hr
$125.00/hr

i $150.00/hr
$100.00/hr
$125.00/hr
$150.00/hr
$125.00/hr
$185.00/hr
$245.00/hr
$100.00lhr

District #1 IDistrict #1
District #2 District #2
District #3 District #4

Merj
$150.00/hr
$195.00/hr
$300.00/hr
$150.00lhr

1
$195.00lhr
$300.00/hr

nlan/a
nia

N/A
$125.00
$125.00
NIA

125.00
$225.00

$150.00/hr
$150.00/hr
$150.00/hr
$150.00/hr
$150.00/hr
I $150.00/hr
I

$125.00 1$150.00/hr
$225.00 $150.00/hr
N/A $150.00/hr
$125.00 $150.00/hr
$125.00 $150.00/hr
125.00 $150.00/hr
125.00 $200.00/hr
225.00 $250.00/hr
NIA $350.00/hr
$125.00+fu$150.0o/hr

I

District #1
¡ District#2

Marty's
$125.00lea
$225.00
NIA
$125.00
I
$225.00
N/A
$5.00/ea
$8.00
NIA

District #1
1 District #2
t

Flat Bed:

District

Fuel Delivery

Part IV. Lock Out Service

Part Ill: Tire Changing:

Battery Replacement:

Price per Mile:

Part V. Winching Service

Heavy I Port to Port
Part II. Battery Service: jump start Light I $95.00/ea

Medium $125.00
Heavy$125.00

Light NIA
Medium NIA

Heavy NIA
Light $95.00lea

Medium N/A
Heavy N/A

Light $95.00/ea
Medium $95.00/ea
Heavy $125.00lea

Light $125.00/hr
Medium $175.00/hr

Heavy $225.00/hr
$125.00+fuel

BID NO: 230284-004 TOWING SERVICES Dadswell
f--- -
I. HOOK UP CHARGE: Light $85.00/ea

Medium$175.00/hr
Heavy $225.00/hr
Light $85.00/ea

Medium $150.00/hr
Heavy $195.00/hr

Light $5.00/ea
Medium Port to Port


