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BID NO: 240325-005 PAPER (1ST QUARTER) EATONS I UZO 1 INTL WB MASON

FIRM FOR FIRM FOR FIRM FOR
1. 8 1/2X11 BOND 5T/CARTON WHITE 3 MTHS 3 MTHS 3 MTHS
RECYCLED PER T NO BID $7.50

..
$7.12

VIRGIN PERT I $7.35 $6.70 $6.42

2. 8 1/2 X 14 BOND 5T/CARTON WHITE I
RECYCLED PER T NO BID NOBID $12.73
VIRGIN PERT $13.00 NO BID sr1.ss

I
3. 11X 17 BOND 2.5T/CARTON WHITE
RECYLCED PER T NOBID NOBID $19.90
VIRGIN PERT I $21.00 NOBID ­ $18.70

I I I
4. 8 1/2 X11 BOND 5T/CARTON STANDARD COLORS I I

I
RECYCLED PER T NOBID NOBID s $10.36
VIRGIN PERT I $10.64 NOBID f $10.36

I I

5. 8 1/2 X 14 BOND 5T/CARTON STANDARD COLORS I I
I

RECYCLED PER T NOBID NO BID NOBID
VIRGIN PERT ,NOBID NO BID - $19.88

i
6. 11X 17 BOND 2.5T/CARTON STANDARD COLORS !
RECYCLED PER T NO BID NOBID NOBID
VIRGIN PERT NO BID NO BID I s31.8o

7. 8 1/2 X1124# 4T/CARTON STANDARD COLORS
RECYCLED PER T NOBID NO BID NOBID
VIRGIN PERT NOBID NOBID NO BID

8. 11X 17 24# 2.5T/CARTON STANDARD COLORS
RECYLCED PER T NOBID NOBID NO BID
VIRGIN PERT NO BID NOBID NO BID

9. ADDITIONAL COST FOR THREE HOLE PUNCH PERT I
81/2X11 NOBID $3.99 $20.00/T
81/2X14 NO BID NO BID S25.00/T

EATON'S STANDARD COLORS: I

8 1/2 X11 Blue, Green, Canary & Pink I

I I
WB MASON COLORS
Blue, Green, Canary, & Pink ! I


