COUNTY OF ERIE

MARK C. POLONCARZ
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

DIVISION OF PURCHASE

To: All Using Departments

From: Jamie Kucewicz, Buyer

Date: March 3, 2025

Subject: TRASH CAN LINERS

Bid No.: 240087-002

Effective Dates: Extended through April 14, 2026

INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP. - VENDOR #103681
114 Bracken Road

Montgomery, NY 12549

Telephone: (845) 457-2700

Fax #: (845) 457-1927

UNIPAK CORP. - VENDOR #113717
PO BOX 300027

Brooklyn, NY 11230

Telephone: (888) 808-5120



PRICING

17" X 18" (HIGH DENSITY)
4 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR BLACK
NOT LESS THAN 6 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: UPC 1718

CASE QUANTITY: 2000

24" X 24" (HIGH DENSITY)
10 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR BLACK
NOT LESS THAN 8 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: INT-2424-L

CASE QUANTITY: 1000

24" X 33" (HIGH DENSITY)
16 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR BLACK
NOT LESS THAN 8 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: UPC 24336
CASE QUANTITY: 1000

28" X 44" (HIGH DENSITY)
16 MICRONS, HEAVY DUTY - BLACK
BRAND/ITEM #:  INT-2844-X-Hvy

CASE QUANTITY: 250

30" X 37" (HIGH DENSITY), WITH TIES
30 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR NATURAL
NOT LESS THAN 16 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: UPC Hd 3716N

CASE QUANTITY: 500

CASE

VENDOR PRICE
Unipak $18.00

Interboro $15.48
Unipak $16.25

Interboro $22.48
Unipak $17.65



VENDOR PRICE
6. 33" X 40" (HIGH DENSITY)
33 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR BLACK Unipak $18.40
NOT LESS THAN 13 MICRONS
BRAND/ITEM #  UPC HD 40H
CASE QUANTITY: 500
7 38" X 58" (LOW DENSITY)
60 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR BLACK Unipak $19.70 (clear)
NOT LESS THAN 2.0 MIL $23.70 (black)
BRAND/ITEM #: UPC 58xh
CASE QUANTITY: 100
8. 38" X 58" (HIGH DENSITY)
60 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR OR BLACK Unipak $21.90
NOT LESS THAN 22 MICRONS
BRAND/ITEM #: UPC 60XH22
CASE QUANTITY: 150
9. 40" X 46" (HIGH DENSITY)
45 GAL CAPACITY — CLEAR Interboro $23.32
NOT LESS THAN 18 MICRONS
250/CASE
BRAND/ITEM #:  INT-4048-MED
CASE QUANTITY: 250
=10. 40" X 48" (HIGH DENSITY)
40-45 GAL CAPACITY - CLEAR Interboro $23.32

NOT LESS THAN 16 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM : INT-4048-MED



CASE QUANTITY: 250

CASE
VENDOR PRICE
11. 6" X 10" .002
CLEAR NO BID
2 MIL

*BAG MUST HAVE PRESS TO CLOSE LIQUID TIGHT CLOSURE THAT IS TAMPER EVIDENT. MUST BE
MARKED IN RED "BIOHAZARD" AND IN BLACK "SPECIMEN BAG".

BRAND/ITEM #:

CASE QUANTITY:

12. 10" X 14" .002 FLAT
CLEAR Interboro $21.84
MINIMUM WEIGHT 18#
BRAND/ITEM #: INT-1014-XH
CASE QUANTITY: 1000

13. 12" X 18" .002 FLAT
CLEAR Interboro $24.82
MINIMUM WEIGHT 28.8#

*BAGS USED FOR SENDING OUT COMPUTER REPORTS.

BRAND/ITEM #: INT-1218-Exh
CASE QUANTITY: 500

14. MBM 0901 SHREDDER BAGS
54" X 48" Interboro $69.82
.002 MM - CLEAR
100/CASE
BRAND/ITEM: INT-5448-EXH
CASE QUANTITY: 100




15. MBM 0901 SHREDDER BAGS
60" X 45" Interboro $78.32
.002 MM
100/CASE

BRAND/ITEM #: INT-6045-EXH

CASE QUANTITY: 100

CASE
VENDOR PRICE
16. 2" X 3" ZIP LOCK TYPE WITH WRITE ON LABEL
CLEAR
.002 MM NO BID
BRAND/ITEM #;
CASE QUANTITY
17. 4" X 6" ZIP LOCK TYPE WITH WRITE ON LABEL
CLEAR -.002 MM NO BID
BRAND/ITEM
CASE QUANTITY:
CASE WEIGHT:
18. 4" X 9" ZIP LOCK TYPE BIOHAZARD SPECIMEN BAG 2 MIL
NO BID
*USED IN HOSPITALS AND LABS TO SAFELY TRANSFER SPECIMIN. PREVENTS
SPILLS. HAS OUTER POUCH TO KEEP PAPERWORK SEPARATE AND SECURE.
BRAND/ITEM #;
CASE QUANTITY:
CASE WEIGHT:
19. 24" X 24" BIOHAZARD
RED ONLY! Interboro $37.34
16 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: INT-2424-REG

CASE QUANTITY: 500



CASE WEIGHT: 16 MC

30" X 37" BIOHAZARD

RED ONLY!

16 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: INT-3037-XH

CASE QUANTITY: 500

33" X 40" BIOHAZARD

RED ONLY!

16 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #: INT-3340-Med

CASE QUANTITY: 250

40" X 48" BIOHAZARD

RED ONLY!

16 MICRONS

BRAND/ITEM #:  INT-4048-X-Hvy

CASE QUANTITY: 250

Interboro $37.84
CASE
VENDOR PRICE
Interboro $19.82
Interboro $34.98



