

3rd Quarter Paper Pricing

7-1-25 to 9-30-25

COUNTY OF ERIE, STATE OF NEW YORK
DIVISION OF PURCHASE
INVITATION TO BID #250027-005

PAGE 2C OF 6 PAGES
95 FRANKLIN ST. RM 1254
BUFFALO NY 14202

PAGE 2C OF 6 PAGES
FRANKLIN ST. RM 1254
NY 14202

PAGE 2C OF 6 PAGES
FRANKLIN ST. RM 1254
NY 14202

BID SPECIFICATIONS

THE FOLLOWING ARE ESTIMATED 3RD QUARTER REQUIREMENTS

ITEM NO	EST. QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRICE PER T	PRICE PER CARTON
---------	----------	-------------	-------------	------------------

1. 22,490 T SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN
SIZE 8 1/2" X 11" BOND
PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON
RECYCLED WHITE STOCK

VIRGIN PAPER WHITE STOCK

WB Mason
7.12/T 35.60
6.32/T 31.60

Eaton's Office

PRICE PER T PRICE PER CARTON

No Bid -
235/T 36.75

Ugo I. Antil

PRICE PER T PRICE PER CARTON

7.00/T 35.00
7.00/T 35.00

2. 680 T SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN
SIZE 8 1/2" X 14" BOND
PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON
RECYCLED WHITE STOCK

VIRGIN PAPER WHITE STOCK

12.73/T 63.65
11.83/T 59.25

No Bid -
13.00/T 65.00

No Bid
No Bid

3. 307 T SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN
SIZE 11" X 17" BOND
PACKED 25T SHEETS PER CARTON
RECYCLED WHITE STOCK

VIRGIN PAPER WHITE STOCK

19.90/T 49.75
18.70/T 46.75

No Bid -
21.00/T 52.50

No Bid
No Bid

4. 1,620 T SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN
SIZE 8 1/2" X 11" BOND
PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON
RECYCLED COLOR STOCK - STANDARD COLORS

VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK STANDARD COLORS

10.36/T 51.80
10.36/T 51.80

No Bid -
10.75/T 53.75

No Bid
No Bid

5. 375 T SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN
SIZE 8 1/2" X 14" BOND
PACKED 5T SHEETS PER CARTON
RECYCLED COLOR STOCK - STANDARD COLORS

VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK STANDARD COLORS

No Bid No Bid
19.88/T 99.40

No Bid -
No Bid -

No Bid
No Bid

NOTE IF CARTON PACKING IS DIFFERENT THAN
NUMBER OF SHEETS PER CARTON INDICATED
ABOVE, PLEASE INDICATE THE QUANTITY.

NAME OF BIDDER WB Mason

Eaton's Office

Ugo I. Antil

COUNTY OF ERIE, STATE OF NEW YORK
DIVISION OF PURCHASE
INVITATION TO BID #250027-005

PAGE 2D OF 6 PAGES
95 FRANKLIN ST, RM 1254
BUFFALO NY 14202

PAGE 2D OF 6 PAGES
95 FRANKLIN ST, RM 1254
BUFFALO NY 14202

PAGE 2D OF 6 PAGES
95 FRANKLIN ST, RM 1254
BUFFALO NY 14202

BID SPECIFICATIONS

THE FOLLOWING ARE ESTIMATED 3RD QUARTER REQUIREMENTS

=====		WB Mason		Eaton's office		Lugo 1 detail			
ITEM NO	EST QTY	DESCRIPTION	PRICE PER T	PRICE PER CARTON	PRICE PER T	PRICE PER CARTON	PRICE PER T	PRICE PER CARTON	
=====									
6.	430 T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 11" X 17" BOND PACKED 2.5T SHEETS PER CARTON RECYCLED <u>COLOR</u> STOCK - STANDARD COLORS	No Bid -		No Bid -		No Bid -		
		VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK STANDARD COLORS	38.97/T	79.50	No Bid -		No Bid -		
7.	1 T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 8 1/2" X 11" BOND PACKED 4T PER CARTON RECYCLED <u>COLOR</u> STOCK	No Bid -		No Bid -		No Bid -		
		VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK	17.70/T	70.80	No Bid -		No Bid -		
8.	1 T	SHEETS 20# - #4 SULPHITE LONG GRAIN SIZE: 11" X 17" BOND PACKED 2.5T SHEETS PER CARTON RECYCLED <u>COLOR</u> STOCK.	No Bid -		No Bid -		No Bid -		
		VIRGIN PAPER COLOR STOCK	38.20/T	95.50	No Bid -		No Bid -		
9.		ADDITIONAL COST FOR THREE HOLE PUNCH PER "T" FOR ITEM NUMBERS 1 - 8							
		(8 1/2" X 11")	\$20.00/T		No Bid		\$10.99/T		
		(8 1/2" X 14")	\$25.00/T		No Bid		No Bid		

NOTE: IF CARTON PACKING IS DIFFERENT THAN NUMBER OF SHEETS PER CARTON INDICATED ABOVE, PLEASE INDICATE THE QUANTITY

NAME OF
BIDDER

WB Mason

Eaton's office

Lugo 1 detail