
COUNTY OF ERIE

DIVISION OF PURCHASE
95 FRANKLIN STREET
BUFFALO, NY 14202

Bid for Plow Parts and Winter Highway Materials
for use by Erie County Department of Public Works

Division of Highways

Submitted in accordance with New York State Specifications
For the period September 1, 2025 August 31, 2026

BID #250180-004



COMPANY

Chemung Supply
PO Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902

Northern Supply
Po Box 69
Bloomfield, NY 14469

Russert Equipment
Po Box 1131
Orchard Park, NY 14127

Viking Cives
2917 Judge Rd.
Oakfield, NY 14125

Winter Equipment
1900 Joseph Lloyd Pkwy
Willoughby, OH 44094

PHONE

(585) 704-5677

(585) 315-1556

(585) 584-3425

(585) 948-5051

(800) 294-6837



250180-004 ERIE COUNTY PLOW PARTS & WINTER MAINTENANCE BID RESULT SHEET Russert Chemung Northern Winter Viking
Snow Drift Control Plastic Fencing Type 1 PAY UNIT BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

50' roll $56.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid
100' roll $98.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid

Snow Fence Posts (Fiberglass)
6' long section No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
8' long section No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid

Sand/ Snow Drift Control - all Plastic Fencing Type II
50' roll $79.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid

100' roll $158.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid
Picket Snow Fence

4' high 50' roll $98.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid
4' high 100' roll No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
6'high 50' roll No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid

Snow Fence Posts
6' long each $10.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid
8' long each $12.00 No bid No bid No Bid No bid

Carbide Insert Blade System Razor Product or Equal
price per 10' No Bid No bid No bid $1,445.40 No bid
price per 11' No Bid No bid No bid $1,534.50 No bid
price per 12' No Bid No bid No bid $1,644.50 No bid

Carbide Insert Blade System Razor XL Product or Equal
price per 1 O' No Bid No bid No bid $2,040.50 No bid
price per 11' No Bid No bid No bid $2,245.10 No bid
price per 12' No Bid No bid No bid $2,448.60 No bid

Carbide Insert Blade System Block Buster or Equal
price per 1 O' No Bid No bid No bid $2,321.00 No bid
price per 11' No Bid No bid No bid $2,552.00 No bid
price per 12' No Bid No bid No bid $2,783.00 No bid

Plow Guard Curb Cast or Equal
Fit a 6" top punch blade $268.00 $310.50 185.00 $204.00 No bid
Fit a 8" top punch blade No Bid No bid No bid $247.00 No bid



230217-004 Item Description Russert Chemung Northern Winter Viking
Plow Guard Jr. or Equal

Fit a 6" top punch blade price each $118.00 $40.44 No bid $127.00 No bid
Fit a 8" top punch blade price each No Bid $59.23 No bid $147.00 No bid

Plow Guard Straight or Equal
Fit a 6" top punch blade price each $238.00 $52.08 135.00 $167.45 No bid
Fit a 8" top punch blade price each No Bid $76.67 No bid $176.80 No bid

Attach catalog with pricing list for additional items
Carbide Matrix Weld Moldboard Shoe price each No Bid No bid No bid $135.00 No bid
Carbide Matrix Weld Frame Shoe price each No Bid No bid No bid $145.00 No bid
Carbide Matrix Weld Mushroom Shoe price each No Bid No bid No bid $130.00 No bid

Carbide Combination Blade
Kuper TUCA SX Wave or equal price per linear inch No Bid No bid 24.00 No Bid No bid
N301-38K, Moldboard Shoe to fit Kuper TUCA SX Wave price each No Bid No bid 210.00 No Bid No bid

Kuper Accessory Products
(Center) (#KUP8Z8000008) price each No Bid No bid 300.00 No Bid No bid
(Left) (#KUP8Z8000010) price each No Bid No bid 325.00 No Bid No bid
(Right) (#KUP8Z8000011) price each No Bid No bid 325.00 No Bid No bid

REACT Flexible Carbide Blade
Price per 10' No Bid No bid 2,900.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 11' No Bid No bid 3,190.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 12' No Bid No bid 3,480.00 No Bid No bid
price for replacement 12" carbide sections price each No Bid No bid 160.00 No Bid No bid
REACT EDGE SPRINGS price each No Bid No bid 5.50 No Bid No bid
REACT BACKER PLATE price per foot No Bid No bid 52.00 No Bid No bid

Trip Edge REACT Flexible Carbide Blade
Price per 10' No Bid No bid 3,250.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 11' No Bid No bid 3,575.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 12' No Bid No bid 3,900.00 No Bid No bid
Trip edge bracket pricee No Bid No bid 110.00 No Bid No bid
Trip Edge backer plate price per fo No Bid No bid 52.00 No Bid No bid

Carbon Steel Cutting Edge For Plow- Wing- Grader
Plow & Wing Flat Blade
1/2" X 6" per linear i No Bid $0.90 No bid No Bid No bid
5/8" X 6" per linear i $2.10 $1.17 No bid No Bid No bid
1/2" X 8" per linear i No Bid $1.39 No bid No Bid No bid
5/8" x 8" per linear i $2.44 $1.52 No bid No Bid No bid
3/4" X 8" per linear i No Bid $1.80 No bid No Bid No bid
Grader Double Bevel
1/2" x6" per linear inch No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
5/8"x6" per linear inch No Bid $2.00 No bid No Bid No bid
1/2" X 8" per linear inch No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
5/8" X 8" per linear inch $3.25 $2.66 No bid No Bid No bid
3/4" X 8" per linear inch $3.82 $3.40 No bid No Bid No bid



230217-004 Item Description Russert Chemung Northern Winter Viking
Plow Guard Jr. or Equal

Fit a 6" top punch blade price each $118.00 $40.44 No bid $127.00 No bid
Fit a 8" top punch blade price each No Bid $59.23 No bid $147.00 No bid

Plow Guard Straight or Equal
Fit a 6" top punch blade price each $238.00 $52.08 135.00 $167.45 No bid
Fit a 8" top punch blade price each No Bid $76.67 No bid $176.80 No bid

Attach catalog with pricing list for additional items
Carbide Matrix Weld Moldboard Shoe price each No Bid No bid No bid $135.00 No bid
Carbide Matrix Weld Frame Shoe price each No Bid No bid No bid $145.00 No bid
Carbide Matrix Weld Mushroom Shoe price each No Bid No bid No bid $130.00 No bid

Carbide Combination Blade
Kuper TUCA SX Wave or equal price per linear inch No Bid No bid 24.00 No Bid No bid
N301-38K, Moldboard Shoe to fit Kuper TUCA SX Wave price each No Bid No bid 210.00 No Bid No bid

Kuper Accessory Products
(Center) (#KUP8Z8000008) price each No Bid No bid 300.00 No Bid No bid
(Left) (#KUP8Z8000010) price each No Bid No bid 325.00 No Bid No bid
(Right) (#KUP8Z8000011) price each No Bid No bid 325.00 No Bid No bid

REACT Flexible Carbide Blade
Price per 10' No Bid No bid 2,900.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 11' No Bid No bid 3,190.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 12' No Bid No bid 3,480.00 No Bid No bid
price for replacement 12" carbide sections price each No Bid No bid 160.00 No Bid No bid
REACT EDGE SPRINGS price each No Bid No bid 5.50 No Bid No bid
REACT BACKER PLATE price per foot No Bid No bid 52.00 No Bid No bid

Trip Edge REACT Flexible Carbide Blade
Price per 10' No Bid No bid 3,250.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 11' No Bid No bid 3,575.00 No Bid No bid
Price per 12' No Bid No bid 3,900.00 No Bid No bid
Trip edge bracket price each No Bid No bid 110.00 No Bid No bid
Trip Edge backer plate price per foot No Bid No bid 52.00 No Bid No bid

Carbon Steel Cutting Edge For Plow- Wing- Grader
Plow&Wing Flat Blade
1/2"x6" per linear inch No Bid $0.90 No bid No Bid No bid
5/8"x6" per linear inch $2.10 $1.17 No bid No Bid No bid
1/2" x 8" per linear inch No Bid $1.39 No bid No Bid No bid
5/8" x 8" per linear inch $2.44 $1.52 No bid No Bid No bid
3/4"x8" per linear inch No Bid $1.80 No bid No Bid No bid
Grader Double Bevel
1/2" x6" per linear inct No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
5/8"x6" per linear inct No Bid $2.00 No bid No Bid No bid
1/2" x8" per linear inct No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid
5/8"x8" per linear inct $3.25 $2.66 No bid No Bid No bid
3/4" x8" per linear inct $3.82 $3.40 No bid No Bid No bid


