
Russert Chemung Northern Winter Viking

ITEM DESCRIPTION PAY UNIT BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE 

Snow Drift Control Plastic Fencing Type 1     
50' Roll Price Per Each $56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100' Roll Price Per Each $98.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Snow Fence Posts (Fiberglass)    
6' Long Section Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8' Long Section Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sand / Snow Drift Control – all Plastic Fencing Type II
50' Roll Price Per Each $79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
100' Roll Price Per Each $158.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4' high 50' Roll Price Per Each $98.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4' high 100' Roll Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6' high 50' Roll Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6' long Each Price Per Each $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8' long Each Price Per Each $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Per 10' No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,445.40 No Bid
Price Per 11' No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,534.50 No Bid
Price Per 12' No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,644.50 No Bid

Price Per 10' No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,040.50 No Bid
Price Per 11' No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,245.10 No Bid
Price Per 12' No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,448.60 No Bid

Price Per 10' No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,321.00 No Bid
Price Per 11' No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,552.00 No Bid
Price Per 12' No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,783.00 No Bid

Fit a 6'' top punch blade Price Per Each $268.00 $310.50 185.00 $204.00 No bid 

Fit a 8'' top punch blade Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $247.00 No bid 

Plow Guard Jr. or Equal
Fit a 6'' top punch blade Price Per Each $118.00 $40.44 No Bid $127.00 No Bid
Fit a 8'' top punch blade                                                        Price Per Each No Bid $59.23 No Bid $147.00 No Bid
Plow Guard Straight or Equal
Fit a 6'' top punch blade                                                            Price Per Each $238.00 $52.08 135.00 $167.45 No Bid
Fit a 8'' top punch blade                                                   Price Per Each No Bid $76.67 No Bid $176.80 No Bid
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Picket Snow Fence

Snow Fence Posts

Carbide Insert Blade System Razor Product or Equal

Carbide Insert Blade System Razor XL Product or Equal

Carbide Insert Blade System Block Buster or Equal

Plow Guard Curb Cast or Equal



Attach catalog with pricing list for additional items
Carbide matrix weld moldboard shoe   Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid
Carbide matrix weld frame shoe     Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid
Carbide matrix weld mushroom shoe    Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 No Bid
Carbide Combination Blade
Kuper TUCA SX Wave or equal Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid 24.00 No Bid No Bid
N301-38K, Moldboard shoe to fit Kuper TUCA SX Wave Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 210.00 No Bid No Bid
Kuper Accessory Products
(Center) (#KUP8Z8000008)   Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 300.00 No Bid No Bid
(Left) (#KUP8Z8000010) Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 325.00 No Bid No Bid
(Right) (#KUP8Z8000011)   Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 325.00 No Bid No Bid
REACT Flexible Carbide Blade

Price Per 10' No Bid No Bid 2,900.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Per 11' No Bid No Bid 3,190.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Per 12' No Bid No Bid 3,480.00 No Bid No Bid

Price for replacement 12" carbide sections Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 160.00 No Bid No Bid
React edge springs Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 5.50 No Bid No Bid
React backer plate Price Per Foot No Bid No Bid 52.00 No Bid No Bid
Trip Edge REACT Flexible Carbide Blade

Price Per 10' No Bid No Bid 3,250.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Per 11' No Bid No Bid 3,575.00 No Bid No Bid
Price Per 12' No Bid No Bid 3,900.00 No Bid No Bid

Trip edge bracket     Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 110.00 No Bid No Bid
Trip edge backer plate   Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 52.00 No Bid No Bid
Carbon Steel Cutting Edge For Plow – Wing – Grader
Plow & wing flat blade                                                
1/2'' x 6''           Price Per Linear Inch No Bid $0.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8'' x 6''         Price Per Linear Inch $2.10 $1.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2'' x 8''            Price Per Linear Inch No Bid $1.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8'' x 8''                                                                       Price Per Linear Inch $2.44 $1.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4'' x 8''           Price Per Linear Inch No Bid $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grader Double Bevel
1/2'' x 6''                                                                   Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8'' x 6''                                                                     Price Per Linear Inch No Bid $2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2'' x 8''                                                               Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8'' x 8''                                                                       Price Per Linear Inch $3.25 $2.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4'' x 8''                                                                    Price Per Linear Inch $3.82 $3.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hardened Cutting Edges Snow Plow Blades
1'' x 8''  Price Per Linear Inch No Bid $2.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SAE grade 8 bolts & nuts   Price For Bolt & Nut No Bid $2.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid



Hardened Cutting Edges For Grader Blades
5/8” to 7/8” x 8” double bevel curved SAE 1074 steel Price Per Linear Inch $3.25 $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SAE grade 8 bolts & nuts   Price For Bolt & Nut $2.95 $2.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hardened Cutting Edges For Serrated Grader Blades
3/4” x 8” heat treated thru hardened steel  Price Per Linear Inch No Bid $4.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SAE grade 8 bolts & nuts   Price For Bolt & Nut $2.95 $2.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Flat Single Bevel Loader Edges
Carbon Steel Blade
1/2'' x 6''          Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4'' x 6''    Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4'' x 8''       Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1'' x 8''       Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1'' x 9''    Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 3/8'' x 10''     Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2'' x 12''    Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Heat Treated  
1/2'' x 6''          Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4'' x 6''    Price Per Linear Inch $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4'' x 8''       Price Per Linear Inch $4.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1'' x 8''       Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1'' x 9''    Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 3/8'' x 10''     Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2'' x 12''    Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rubber Snow Plow Blade  
50ft. rolls unpunched     Price Per Foot $42.00 $31.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid
50ft. rolls punched and fabricated     Price Per Foot $42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each blade punched and fabricated    Price Per Foot $42.00 $31.95 No bid No Bid No Bid

Flexible Plow Blade  
Polar-Flex 10' Price Per 10' 2,812.50 $3,174.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Polar Flex 11' Price Per 11' 3,093.75 $3,492.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polar Flex 12' Price Per 12' 3,375.00 $3,809.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sabre Blade

Price Per Foot No Bid $293.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Evolution Edges – VST (Vibration Suppression Technology) Blade or Equal
Price Per Foot No Bid $317.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Single Edge Carbide Blade
Price Per Linear Inch $6.83 $6.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Single Edge Carbide Blade **Kennametal Only**
Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid 6.50 No Bid No Bid

Kennametal XT Blade



Price Per Linear Inch No Bid No Bid 10.00 No Bid No Bid
Kennametal XT Blade For Fisher & Western 
Straight plow Price Per Linear Inch $13.16 No Bid 12.00 No Bid No Bid
V-PLW welded nose piece iIncl. Price Per Linear Inch $13.16 No Bid 13.50 No Bid No Bid

Kennametal Accessory Products
KCWB-0307A Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 250.00 No Bid No Bid

KCWB-0574 Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 325.00 No Bid No Bid

KCWB-0519 Price Per Each No Bid No Bid 550.00 No Bid No Bid

Plow & Wing Replacement Parts
Cast nihard moldboard shoes
N301-34A, 65 Degree cast nihard, 6'' top punch, 12'' spacing Price Per Each $138.00 $79.52 100.00 No Bid No Bid

N301-29A, 55 Degree cast nihard, 6'' top punch, 12'' spacing Price Per Each No Bid $57.21 95.00 No Bid No Bid

Cast steel mnoldboard shoes
12'' Spacing, 6'' top punch, Price Per Each No Bid $78.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fabricated steel moldboard shoe Price Per Each No Bid
# OST-610 or equal Price Per Each No Bid $80.42 85.00 No Bid No Bid

# OST-610-60 or equal Price Per Each No Bid $100.79 85.00 No Bid No Bid

Cast steel wing shoe
12'' Spacing, 6'' top punch, Price Per Each No Bid $60.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fabricated steel wing shoe
# OST-400 or equal Price Per Each $98.00 $88.02 85.00 No Bid No Bid

Cast nihard wing shoes
N301-39, 85 Degree cast nihard, 6'' top punch, 12'' spacing Price Per Each $138.00 $79.57 100.00 No Bid No Bid

N301-33, 75 Degree cast nihard, 6'' top punch, 12'' spacing Price Per Each $138.00 $79.57 95.00 No Bid No Bid

Nose shoes
Steel nose shoe to fit 6” top punch blade Price Per Each $88.00 $45.38 55.00 No Bid No Bid

Steel nose shoe to fit 8” top punch blade Price Per Each No Bid $56.53 65.00 No Bid No Bid

Plow frame shoes
Cast flat frame shoe 6” on center @ 30 lbs Price Per Each No Bid $149.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast flat frame shoe 6” on center @ 30 lbs w/ Carbide Price Per Each $215.00 $277.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast flat frame shoe 6” on center @ 40 lbs Price Per Each No Bid $170.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast flat frame shoe 6” on center @ 40 lbs w/ Carbide Price Per Each No Bid $297.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast boat shoe 16 ½” on center @ 68 lbs Price Per Each $148.00 $187.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast boat shoe 16 ½” on center @ 68 lbs w/ Carbide Price Per Each $234.00 $324.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast mushroom shoe 6” on center @ 49 lbs Price Per Each $178.00 $82.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cast mushroom shoe 6” on center @ 49 lbs w/ Carbide Price Per Each $289.00 $324.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steel flat frame shoe 6” on center @ 50 lbs. Price Per Each No Bid $101.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steel flat frame shoe 6” on center @ 50 lbs. w/ Carbide Price Per Each $234.00 $149.86 205.00 No Bid No Bid
Steel boat frame shoe 1” x 7” x 22”; 16 ½” on center @ 46 lbs. Price Per Each $230.00 $163.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steel boat frame shoe 1” x 7” x 22”; 16 ½” on center @ 46 lbs. w/ Carbide Price Per Each $280.00 $328.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid



Shoe adapter bracket Price Per Each $90.00 $141.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kennametal kencast frame shoe, KCWB-0167 Price Per Each No Bid $270.58 330.00 No Bid No Bid
Cast nihard frame shoe #N301-11-3 Price Per Each $110.00 $170.10 110.00 No Bid No Bid
Cast nihard mushroom shoe #N301-105-3 Price Per Each $158.00 $117.31 145.00 No Bid No Bid
Cast nihard boat shoe #N301-3-2 Price Per Each No Bid $300.24 145.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturers Plow Parts List *Price list must be included*
Everest % Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Frink % Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tenco % Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Viking 30% Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20,140.00

Fisher % Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Western % Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sander Parts
Sander chain        Price Per Foot $46.50 $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic motor to drive apron chain Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic motor to drive spinner      Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinner with hub- poly 18" Price Per Each $221.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinner with hub- poly 20"      Price Per Each $248.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinner with hub- steel 18"   Price Per Each $245.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinner with hub- steel 20"     Price Per Each $260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stainless steel 18"  Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stainless steel 20"    Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Misc. Sander Parts
Snith sanders        30% Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00%
Saltdogg sanders   30% Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00%
Spreader Controls 
Comp-U-Spread 30% Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00%
Dickey John 30% Discount off List Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.00%

Fiber additive for hot mix asphalt Price Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fiber additive for hot mix asphalt Price Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix for Winter Use                                                                                                      

Price Per Ton No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid

Price Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cold Patch Mix Asphalt Pavements Additives

High Intensity Prismatic Reflective Sheeting, Rolls                                                         

Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement Additives


